
Charter Bus Services
 ITB #2411-2024

Awarded Contractors

Vendor A Candies Coachworks Annett Bus Lines Astro Travel & Tours

Contact Name James Henry Debbie Montoya Kurt Woodward

Contact E-Mail operations@candiesmotorcoaches.com debbie@annettbuslines.com kwoodward@astrotravel.com

Contact Phone # (352) 332-4334 / (352) 278-0463 (800) 282-3655 / (850) 234-3459 (850) 514-1793
5 Hour Minimum Trip

20-29 Passenger Up to $2,400. No Bid No Bid

30-47 Passenger No Bid $4,212.00 $1,450.00

48-55 Passenger No Bid $4,212.00 No Bid

56-77 Passenger Up to $2,500. $4,212.00 $1,675.00
*Greater Than 5 Hour-Less Than 10 Hours

20-29 Passenger (Hourly) $150.00 - $400.00 No Bid No Bid

20-29 (Per Mile) $6.00 - $10.00 No Bid No Bid

30-47 Passenger (Hourly) No Bid $571.00 $1,450. - $2,850. /Flat Rate

30-47 Passenger (Per Mile) No Bid $8.97 $5.25

48-55 Passenger (Hourly) No Bid $571.00 No Bid

48-55 Passenger (Per Mile) No Bid $8.97 No Bid

56-77 Passenger (Hourly) $175.00 - $400.00 $571.00 $1,675. - $3,300./Flat Rate

56-77 Passenger (Per Mile) $6.00 - $10.00 $8.97 $6.50
**Multiday/Overnight Per Day

20-29 Passenger $1,675.00 - $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid

30-47 Passenger No Bid $7,404.00 $1,450. - $2,805.

48-55 Passenger No Bid $7,404.00 No Bid

56-77 Passenger $1,775.00 - $2,600.00 $7,404.00 $1,675. - $3.300.
*** Premium Rate Per Hour

20-29 Passenger $225.00 - $275.00 No Bid No Bid

30-47 Passenger No Bid $889.00 $2,450. - $4,000.

48-55 Passenger No Bid $889.00 No Bid

56-77 Passenger $250.00 - $300.00 $889.00 $2,750. - $5,200.

Flat Rate Cancellation Fee $250.00 $250.00 $250.00

** Pricing per day on multiple day/overnight trips and mileage rate; these rates shall include a second driver for compliance with drive time regulations.   The District will pay for 
lodgings for the driver(s) at the same premise of staff and students.   Calculations of hourly/daily rates actual mileage must be presented with each invoice; with the greater sum as the 
actual charges.
***This Rate may be charged for Grad Night (Disney World) and other events recognized by the District.

* In Addition to Flat Rate. Trips over 5 hours will be billled at either the rate per hour or by mileage.  The greater amount will prevail.
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